
Bid # 2022-02                                                                                                                                                                                 
Coach Bus Transportation 
Services                                                                                                                                                
Bid Opening: March 2, 2022 at 10:00 AM

Trip Location -- TRAVEL CAMP PROGRAM Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus
Shuttling Marlboro Aquatic Center/Marlboro Swim 
Club - Marlboro, NJ

No Bid 1,537.91 No Bid 795.00

Island Beach State Park – Seaside Park, NJ No Bid 1,698.28 15.00 895.00
Jenkinson’s Boardwalk – Point Pleasant, NJ No Bid 1,593.94 No Bid 845.00
Sandy Hook Beach – Sandy Hook, NJ No Bid 1,522.74 No Bid 845.00
Seven President’s Beach – Long Branch, NJ No Bid 1,485.15 No Bid 845.00
The Funplex – Mt. Laurel, NJ No Bid 1,590.69 No Bid 895.00
Jersey Shore Arena – Wall, NJ No Bid 1,467.56 No Bid 795.00
Medieval Times – Lyndhurst, NJ No Bid 1,555.50 No Bid 895.00
Splashplex – East Hanover, NJ No Bid 1,573.09 No Bid 895.00
Ice World Poolplex – Middletown, NJ No Bid 1,449.96 No Bid 795.00
Ocean County Park – Lakewood, NJ No Bid 1,520.33 No Bid 845.00
Casino Pier – Seaside park, NJ No Bid 1,630.69 No Bid 895.00
Lakeview Marina - Sparta, NJ No Bid 1,643.45 No Bid 945.00
Steel Pier - Atlantic City, NJ No Bid 1,740.19 No Bid 995.00
Treetop Adventure Course - West Orange, NJ No Bid 1,555.50 No Bid 845.00
Peddles & Paddles - Seaside Heights, NJ No Bid 1,577.91 No Bid 845.00
Skyzone – Ocean Township, NJ No Bid 1,485.15 No Bid 795.00

Keansburg Amusement/Water Park – Keansburg, NJ No Bid 1,476.35 No Bid 795.00

Broadway Show - New York, NY No Bid 1,625.86 No Bid 895.00
Circle Line Cruise - New York, NY No Bid 1,625.86 No Bid 895.00
Hurricane Harbor – Jackson, NJ No Bid 1,515.15 No Bid 845.00
Belmar Beach – Belmar, NJ No Bid 1,502.74 No Bid 845.00
AMC Theaters, New Brunswick, NJ No Bid 1,485.15 No Bid 795.00
Adventure Aquarium – Camden, NJ No Bid 1,635.86 No Bid 945.00
Lakewood Blue Claws – Lakewood, NJ No Bid 1,520.33 No Bid 845.00
The Franklin Institute – Philadelphia, PA No Bid 1,643.45 No Bid 945.00
RPM Raceway - Jersey City, NJ No Bid 1,537.91 No Bid 845.00
Clementon Amusement Park & Splash World – 
Clementon, NJ

No Bid 1,625.86 No Bid 945.00

Somerset Patriots – Somerset, NJ No Bid 1,520.33 No Bid 845.00
Branchburg Sports Complex – Branchburg, NJ No Bid 1,555.50 No Bid 845.00

Stout's Charter Service                           
20 Irven Street                                      
Trenton, NJ 08638

Suburban Transit Corp.                                           
750 Somerset Street                                                   
New Brunswick, NJ 

08901            



Trip Location -- TRAVEL CAMP PROGRAM Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus

Stout's Charter Service                           
20 Irven Street                                      
Trenton, NJ 08638

Suburban Transit Corp.                                           
750 Somerset Street                                                   
New Brunswick, NJ 

08901            

I PLAY America – Freehold, NJ No Bid 1,449.96 No Bid 795.00
Rockville Climbing Center –Hamilton, NJ No Bid 1,520.33 No Bid 845.00
Gravity Vault - Middletown, NJ No Bid 1,467.56 No Bid 795.00
Dave & Busters - Woodbridge, NJ No Bid 1,485.15 No Bid 795.00
Brunswick Zone - Hazlet, NJ No Bid 1,449.96 No Bid 795.00
Liberty Science Center – Jersey City, No Bid 1,547.91 No Bid 845.00
Splash Zone – Wildwood, NJ ** Extended day 4:00 
pm return

No Bid 1,945.73 No Bid 1,295.00

Sahara Sam’s – West Berlin, NJ ** Extended day 
4:00 pm return

No Bid 1,625.86 No Bid 995.00

Madison Square Garden – New York, NY ** 
Extended day 4:00 pm return

No Bid 1,625.86 No Bid 995.00

Great Adventure – Jackson, NJ ** Extended day 4:30 
pm return

No Bid 1,560.15 No Bid 945.00

Philadelphia Zoo – Philadelphia, PA ** Extended 
day 4:00 pm return

No Bid 1,661.04 No Bid 1,045.00

Philadelphia Phillies – Philadelphia, PA ** Extended 
day 4:30 pm return

No Bid 1,741.25 No Bid 1,045.00

The Quarry Swim Club - Hopewell, NJ ** Extended 
day 4:00 pm return

No Bid 1,537.91 No Bid 945.00

Buck's County River Country - Point Pleasant, PA ** 
Extended day 8:00 am-4:30 pm

No Bid 1,670.86 No Bid 995.00

Twin Rivers Tubing - Phillipsburg, PA ** Extended 
Day 4:00 pm return

No Bid 1,661.04 No Bid 1,045.00

Mountain Creek - Vernon, NJ **Extended day 8:00 
am-6:00 pm

No Bid 1,786.21 No Bid 1,095.00

Dorney Park and Wildwater Kingdom – Allentown, 
PA**Extended day 8am-5pm

No Bid 1,793.99 No Bid 1,095.00

Camelbeach Mountain Waterpark – Tannersville, PA 
** Extended day 8am-5pm

No Bid 1,846.15 No Bid 1,195.00

TOTAL No Bid 76,275.31 No Bid 43,510.00
CANCELLATION FEE PER BUS (percentage) - < 
24 hours notice

No Bid 50% No Bid
10%

CANCELLATION FEE PER BUS (percentage) - < 5 
hours notice

No Bid 100% No Bid
25%



Bid Opening: March 2, 2022 at 10:00 AM

Trip Location -- SENIOR PROGRAM Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus Per 48/p Bus Per 56/p Bus
Spring Lake, NJ (Doolan’s) No Bid 1,665.16 No Bid 895.00

West Hampton , NJ (Hunterdon Hills Playhouse) No Bid 1,788.98 No Bid 995.00

Millburn, NJ (Paper Mill Playhouse) No Bid 1,717.91 No Bid 895.00

Red Bank, NJ (Two River Theater) No Bid 1,629.96 No Bid 845.00

Wayne, PA (Chanticleer /Margaret Kuo) No Bid 1,841.04 No Bid 1,095.00

Lancaster, PA (American Music Theater/Fulton Steamboat Inn) No Bid 1,999.34 No Bid 1,395.00

Elmsford, NY (Westchester Dinner Theater) No Bid 1,841.04 No Bid 1,095.00

Toms River, NJ (River Lady Cruise) No Bid 1,735.50 No Bid 895.00

Kennett Square, PA (Longwood Gardens) No Bid 1,920.19 No Bid 1,195.00
New York City (Various, specific destinations TBD) No Bid 1,805.86 No Bid 995.00
Smithville (Ocean County), NJ No Bid 1,858.63 No Bid 1,095.00

Atlantic City, NJ (Casino TBD) No Bid 1,911.40 No Bid 1,195.00

USMA - West Pont, NY No Bid 1,893.81 No Bid 1,195.00

Atlantic Highlands, NJ (Shore Casino) No Bid 1,647.56 No Bid 845.00

Long Branch, NJ (NJ Repertory Company) No Bid 1,665.15 No Bid 845.00

Asbury Park, NJ (Culinary Education Center) No Bid 1,665.15 No Bid 895.00

Morristown, NJ (Bickford Theater) No Bid 1,753.09 No Bid 995.00

Philadelphia, PA (Various, specific destinations TBD) No Bid 1,849.84 No Bid 1,095.00

Allentown, PA (Pines Theater) No Bid 1,911.40 No Bid 1,195.00

Paradise, PA (Rainbow Dinner Theater) No Bid 1,990.55 No Bid 1,295.00

Beach Haven, NJ (Surflight Theater) No Bid 1,841.04 No Bid 1,095.00

Manahawkin, NJ (Ocean Professional Theater) No Bid 1,788.28 No Bid 995.00

West Orange, NJ No Bid 1,770.69 No Bid 895.00

Paterson, NJ (The Brownstone) No Bid 1,753.09 No Bid 995.00

Bristol, PA (Bristol Riverside Theater) No Bid 1,735.50 No Bid 995.00

Garfield, NJ (The Royal Manor) No Bid 1,753.09 No Bid 995.00

New Brunswick, NJ (George Street Playhouse) No Bid 1,665.15 No Bid 845.00

Livingston, NJ (State Theater of NJ) No Bid 1,665.15 No Bid 895.00

Belmar, NJ (Tranquil Garden Tea Room) No Bid 1,665.15 No Bid 895.00

Trenton, NJ (Trenton Thunder) No Bid 1,717.91 No Bid 895.00

TOTAL No Bid 53,446.61 No Bid 30,450.00

Handicap Bus Rate No Bid Same as above No Bid Same as above

Cancellation Fee Per Bus (percentage) No Bid 50% No Bid 25%

Stout's Charter Service                                                     
20 Irven Street                                      
Trenton, NJ 08638

Suburban Transit Corp.                                           
750 Somerset Street                                                   
New Brunswick, NJ 08901            

Bid # 2022-02                                                                                                                                                                                 
Coach Bus Transportation Services for the Recreation Department                                                                                                                                          
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