
NO. ITEM QTY. UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

1 ¾” BRASS CAP 2 Ea. 29.00 58.00 22.00 44.00 

2 1” BRASS CAP 2 Ea. 50.00 100.00 37.50 75.00 

3 2” BRASS CAP 2 Ea. 125.00 250.00 94.00 188.00 

4 ¾” SOLID COPPER DISC 2 Ea. 5.00 10.00 2.50 5.00 

5 1” SOLID COPPER DISC 2 Ea. 5.00 10.00 2.50 5.00 

6 2” SOLID COPPER DISC 2 Ea. 15.00 30.00 7.50 15.00 

7 ¾” M MIP X COMP ADAPTER 4 Ea. 44.50 178.00 31.50 126.00 

8 1” M MIP X COMP ADAPTER 4 Ea. 50.00 200.00 35.50 142.00 

9 ¾” FIP X COMP ADAPTER 3 Ea. 47.00 141.00 33.00 99.00 

10 1” M FIP X COMP ADAPTER 4 Ea. 60.00 240.00 42.50 170.00 

11 4’ M CURB BOX LESS ROD 6 Ea. 55.00 330.00 38.50 231.00 

12 5’ M CURB BOX LESS ROD 2 Ea. 59.00 118.00 41.50 83.00 

13 29” STAINLESS STEEL ROD 6 Ea. 25.00 150.00 18.00 108.00 

5¼” M A423 CENTURION HYD 

Gate vale and hydrants Price to include Megalugs & 316 SS 

bolt package (with gaskets) With option B06 on hydrants

16
6” M MJ RW GATE VLV Price to include Megalugs & 316 

SS bolt package (with gaskets)
2 Ea. 1,200.00 2,400.00 907.00 1,814.00 

17
8” M MJ RW GATE VLV Price to include Megalugs & 316 

SS bolt package (with gaskets)
2 Ea. 1,850.00 3,700.00 1,407.00 2,814.00 

18
10” M MJ RW GATE VLV Price to include Megalugs & 316 

SS bolt package (with gaskets)
2 Ea. 2,800.00 5,600.00 2,081.00 4,162.00 

19
12” M MJ RW GATE VLV Price to include Megalugs & 316 

SS bolt package (with gaskets)
2 Ea. 3,520.00 7,040.00 2,630.00 5,260.00 

20
16" Lineseal III Butterfly Valve Class 150B MJ Ends Price to 

include Megalugs & 316 SS bolt package (with gaskets)
1 Ea. 4,500.00 4,500.00 4,177.00 4,177.00 

14 4

Kennedy Culvert & Supply           

125 6th Ave                         

Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054

Ea
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14,360.00 3,000.00 12,000.00 3,590.00 
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21
20" Lineseal III Butterfly Valve Class 150B MJ Ends Price to 

include Megalugs & 316 SS bolt package (with gaskets)
1 Ea. 6,950.00 6,950.00 5,883.00 5,883.00 

22
24" Lineseal III Butterfly Valve Class 150B MJ Ends Price to 

include Megalugs & 316 SS bolt package (with gaskets)
1 Ea. 12,000.00 12,000.00 8,346.00 8,346.00 

23
36" Lineseal III Butterfly Valve Class 150B MJ Ends Price to 

include Megalugs & 316 SS bolt package (with gaskets)
1 Ea. 30,350.00 30,350.00 16,515.00 16,515.00 

24 4’ 2” PC SLIP TYPE VALVE BOX W/LID 2 Ea. 230.00 460.00 No Bid 0.00 

25 5’ 2” PC SLIP TYPE VALVE BOX W/LID 2 Ea. 280.00 560.00 No Bid 0.00 

26 1” VALVE BOX RISER LESS LID 20 Ea. 20.00 400.00 No Bid 0.00 

27 1½” VALVE BOX RISER LESS LID 25 Ea. 23.00 575.00 No Bid 0.00 

24 2” VALVE BOX RISER LESS LID 25 Ea. 27.00 675.00 No Bid 0.00 

28 3” VALVE BOX RISER LESS LID 10 Ea. 38.00 380.00 No Bid 0.00 

29 4” VALVE BOX RISER LESS LID 2 Ea. 50.00 100.00 No Bid 0.00 

30 5 ¼” WATER LID 100 Ea. 35.00 3,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

31 10 ½” SLIP VALVE BOX TOP 36 Ea. 60.00 2,160.00 No Bid 0.00 

32 4” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 42.00 1,680.00 34.80 1,392.00 

33 6” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 100 Ft. 32.00 3,200.00 26.76 2,676.00 

34 8” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 60 Ft. 45.00 2,700.00 37.76 2,265.60 

35 10” Cl52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 58.00 2,320.00 49.42 1,976.80 

36 12” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 77.00 3,080.00 62.34 2,493.60 

37 14” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 70.00 2,800.00 85.99 3,439.60 

38 16” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 120.00 4,800.00 90.22 3,608.80 

39 20” CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 130.00 5,200.00 118.43 4,737.20 

40 24" CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 180.00 7,200.00 148.56 5,942.40 

41 36" CL52 TYTON DIP CL 40 Ft. 310.00 12,400.00 240.00 9,600.00 

42 5 ¼” SAFETY FLANGE REPAIR KIT 30 Ea. 310.00 9,300.00 221.00 6,630.00 
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43 BONNET REPAIR KIT CENTURION 75 Ea. 140.00 10,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

44 6” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 1,200.00 2,400.00 874.00 1,748.00 

45 12” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 7 Ea. 1,400.00 9,800.00 1,012.00 7,084.00 

46 18” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 1,650.00 3,300.00 1,189.00 2,378.00 

47 24” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 1,800.00 3,600.00 1,269.00 2,538.00 

48 4 ½” SAFETY FLANGE REPAIR KIT 30 Ea. 310.00 9,300.00 221.00 6,630.00 

49 4 ½” SAFETY FLANGE REPAIR KIT 30 Ea. 310.00 9,300.00 221.00 6,630.00 

50 6” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 600.00 1,200.00 458.00 916.00 

51 12” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 7 Ea. 700.00 4,900.00 533.00 3,731.00 

52 18” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 750.00 1,500.00 577.00 1,154.00 

53 24” HYDRANT EXTENSION W/KIT 2 Ea. 850.00 1,700.00 645.00 1,290.00 

54 4” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 80.00 160.00 No Bid 0.00 

55 6” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 100.00 200.00 No Bid 0.00 

56 8” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 150.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

57 10” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 190.00 380.00 No Bid 0.00 

58 12” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 240.00 480.00 No Bid 0.00 

59 16” PS 3501 COUPLING BXB GSKT 2 Ea. 425.00 850.00 No Bid 0.00 

60
4.74 - 5.57 OD X 6” PS 3121-PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 105.00 210.00 No Bid 0.00 

61
4.74 -5.57 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
2 Ea. 135.00 270.00 No Bid 0.00 

62
6.56 - 7.60 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 160.00 320.00 No Bid 0.00 

63
6.84 - 7.60 OD X 6” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
4 Ea. 125.00 500.00 No Bid 0.00 

64
6.84 - 7.60 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
6 Ea. 160.00 960.00 No Bid 0.00 

65
6.84 - 7.60 OD X 16” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
1 Ea. 195.00 195.00 No Bid 0.00 
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66
6.84 - 7.60 OD X 20” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
1 250.00 250.00 No Bid 0.00 

67
6.84 - 7.60 OD X 24” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
1 300.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

68
8.99 - 9.79 OD X 6” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
2 Ea. 200.00 400.00 No Bid 0.00 

69
8.99 - 9.79 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 210.00 420.00 No Bid 0.00 

70
8.99 - 9.79 OD X 16” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 220.00 440.00 No Bid 0.00 

71
8.99 - 9.79 OD X 20" PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 280.00 560.00 No Bid 0.00 

72
8.99 - 9.79 X 24" PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
2 330.00 660.00 No Bid 0.00 

73
11.04 - 12.12 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 225.00 450.00 No Bid 0.00 

74
11.04 - 12.12 OD X 16" PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 270.00 540.00 No Bid 0.00 

75
11.04 - 12.12 OD X 20" PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 340.00 680.00 No Bid 0.00 

76
11.04 - 12.12 OD X 24" PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 400.00 800.00 No Bid 0.00 

77
13.20 - 14.38 OD X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND 
2 Ea. 225.00 450.00 No Bid 0.00 

78
13.20 - 14.38 X 12” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
2 Ea. 225.00 450.00 No Bid 0.00 

79
13.20 - 14.38 X 16” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
2 Ea. 300.00 600.00 No Bid 0.00 

80
13.20 - 14.38 X 20” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
1 Ea. 400.00 400.00 No Bid 0.00 

81
13.20 - 14.38 X 24” PS 3121-AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC SINGLE 

BAND 
1 Ea. 490.00 490.00 No Bid 0.00 
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82
21.60 - 25.30 OD X 16" PS 3121 -AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 1,250.00 1,250.00 No Bid 0.00 

83
21.60 - 25.30 OD X 20" PS 3121 -AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 1,750.00 1,750.00 No Bid 0.00 

84
21.60 - 25.30 OD X 24" PS 3121 -AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 2,350.00 2,350.00 No Bid 0.00 

85
21.60 - 25.30 OD X 36" PS 3121 -AS CLAMP W/ 1"CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 3,400.00 3,400.00 No Bid 0.00 

86
25.80 - 29.98 OD X 24" PS 3121- AS CLAMP W/ 1" CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 2,800.00 2,800.00 No Bid 0.00 

87
25.80 - 29.98 OD X 36" PS 3121- AS CLAMP W/ 1" CC 

SINGLE BAND
1 Ea. 3,950.00 3,950.00 No Bid 0.00 

88 38.30 OD X 36" PS 3121- AS CLAMP SINGLE BAND 1 3,900.00 3,900.00 No Bid 0.00 

89 2” HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 140.00 280.00 No Bid 0.00 

90 4” HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 240.00 480.00 No Bid 0.00 

91 6” HYMAX COUPLING 16 Ea. 325.00 5,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

92 8” HYMAX COUPLING 14 Ea. 365.00 5,110.00 No Bid 0.00 

93 10” HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 470.00 940.00 No Bid 0.00 

94 12” HYMAX COUPLING 6 Ea. 670.00 4,020.00 No Bid 0.00 

95 16” HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,490.00 2,980.00 No Bid 0.00 

96 20” HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,500.00 3,000.00 No Bid 0.00 

97 24" HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 2,050.00 4,100.00 No Bid 0.00 

98 36" HYMAX COUPLING 2 Ea. 4,100.00 8,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

99 6" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 580.00 1,160.00 No Bid 0.00 

100 8" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 760.00 1,520.00 No Bid 0.00 

101 10" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 950.00 1,900.00 No Bid 0.00 

102 12" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,130.00 2,260.00 No Bid 0.00 

103 16" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 3,600.00 7,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

104 20" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,050.00 2,100.00 No Bid 0.00 
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105 24" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,270.00 2,540.00 No Bid 0.00 

106 36" ROMAC COUPLING 2 Ea. 1,700.00 3,400.00 No Bid 0.00 

107 4” MEGA LUG MJ RETAINER GLAND 2 Ea. 35.00 70.00 No Bid 0.00 

108 6” MEGA LUG MJ RETAINER GLAND 20 Ea. 43.00 860.00 No Bid 0.00 

109 8” MEGA LUG MJ RETAINER GLAND 10 Ea. 66.00 660.00 No Bid 0.00 

110 10” MEGA LUG RET. GLAND 2 Ea. 98.00 196.00 No Bid 0.00 

111 12” MEGA LUG MJ RET GLAND 12 Ea. 140.00 1,680.00 No Bid 0.00 

112
Megalug® 16 in. Mechanical Joint Wedge Restraint For 

Valves, Hydrants and Ductile Iron Pipe
2 Ea. 260.00 520.00 No Bid 0.00 

113 FIRE HYDRANT OUT OF SERVICE BAGS ( PLASTIC ) 12 Ea. 46.00 552.00 No Bid 0.00 

114
Megalug® 20 in. Mechanical Joint Wedge Restraint For 

Valves, Hydrants and Ductile Iron Pipe
2 Ea. 452.00 904.00 No Bid 0.00 

115
Megalug® 24 in. Mechanical Joint Wedge Restraint For 

Valves, Hydrants and Ductile Iron Pipe
2 Ea. 1,100.00 2,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

116 Megalug 36 in. Split Restraint for Ductile Iron Pipe 2 Ea. 4,200.00 8,400.00 No Bid 0.00 

117 4” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 125.00 250.00 No Bid 0.00 

118 6” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 20 Ea. 175.00 3,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

119 8” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 10 Ea. 180.00 1,800.00 No Bid 0.00 

120 10” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 240.00 480.00 No Bid 0.00 

121 12” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 12 Ea. 250.00 3,000.00 No Bid 0.00 

122 16” 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 380.00 760.00 No Bid 0.00 

123 20" 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 450.00 900.00 No Bid 0.00 

124 24" 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 610.00 1,220.00 No Bid 0.00 

125 36" 304SS MJ BOLT PACK W/ GASKET 2 Ea. 1,600.00 3,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

126 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 4½” 6 Ea. 550.00 3,300.00 426.00 2,556.00 

127 MAIN VALVE REPAIR KIT 5¼” 6 Ea. 650.00 3,900.00 520.00 3,120.00 

128 SHOE REPAIR KIT 4½” 2 Ea. 375.00 750.00 297.00 594.00 
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129 SHOE REPAIR KIT 5¼” 12 Ea. 425.00 5,100.00 328.00 3,936.00 

130 107 CONVERSION KIT (BONNET REPLACEMENT KIT) 2 Ea. 650.00 1,300.00 441.00 882.00 

131 MUELLER 300 METER BALL VALVES 2 Ea. 185.00 370.00 No Bid 0.00 

132 11 OZ. AEROSOL CAN ANTI-SIEZE 12 Ea. 26.00 312.00 No Bid 0.00 

133 3/4" FLARE X COMPRSSION 30.00 60.00 No Bid 0.00 

134 1" FLARE X COMPRESSION 40.00 80.00 No Bid 0.00 

135 2" FLARE X COMPRESSION 130.00 260.00 No Bid 0.00 

136 3/4" COMP X COMP UNION 33.00 66.00 No Bid 0.00 

137 1" COMP X COMP UNION 36.00 72.00 No Bid 0.00 

138 2" COMP X COMP UNION 160.00 320.00 No Bid 0.00 

139
POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 12 inches 

wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick
2 Roll 333.00 666.00 No Bid 0.00 

140 5 ¼” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 195.00 195.00 

141 4 ½” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 203.00 203.00 

142 4 ½” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 203.00 203.00 

143 5 ¼” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 212.00 212.00 

144 4 ½” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 No Bid 0.00 

145 5 ¼” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 No Bid 0.00 

146 5 ¼” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 No Bid 0.00 

147 5 ¼” HYDRANT UPPER STEM 1 Ea. 550.00 550.00 No Bid 0.00 

148 5 ¼” M HYDRANT LOWER STEM 1 Ea. 650.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

149 5 ¼” M HYDRANT LOWER STEM 1 Ea. 650.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

150 5 ¼” M HYDRANT LOWER STEM 1 Ea. 650.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

151 4 ¼” M HYDRANT LOWER STEM 1 Ea. 650.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

152 1’ – 6’ 5 ¼” HYDRANT EXTENSION STEM ONLY 2 Ea. 275.00 550.00 No Bid 0.00 

153 4 ½” NST PUMPER NOZZLE 30 Ea. 350.00 10,500.00 254.00 7,620.00 

154 4 ½” NST PUMPER NOZZLE CAP 30 Ea. 270.00 8,100.00 192.00 5,760.00 

155 PUMPER NOZZLE CAP GASKET 30 Ea. 21.00 630.00 14.25 427.50 

2 Ea. 

2 Ea. 

Page 7 of 14



NO. ITEM QTY. UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL

Kennedy Culvert & Supply           

125 6th Ave                         

Mt. Laurel, NJ 08054

Ferguson Ent, LLC              

190 Oberlin Ave                                 

Lakewood, NJ 08701

Marlboro Township                                                                                                                      

Bid #2022-01 Water Distribution Products                                                                                         

Bid Opening: February 16, 2022 @ 10:00 AM

156 PUMPER NOZZLE O-RING 30 Ea. 13.00 390.00 8.50 255.00 

157 2 ½” NST HOSE NOZZLE 30 Ea. 125.00 3,750.00 79.00 2,370.00 

158 HOSE NOZZLE CAP GASKET 30 Ea. 9.00 270.00 4.75 142.50 

159 2 ½” HOSE NOZZLE CAP 30 Ea. 125.00 3,750.00 81.50 2,445.00 

160 NOZZLE LOCK 30 Ea. 1.50 45.00 1.00 30.00 

161 ADJUSTABLE HYDRANT WRENCH 5 Ea. 50.00 250.00 977.00 4,885.00 

162 GALLON HYDRANT LUBE 5 Ea. 70.00 350.00 57.00 285.00 

163 HYDRANT CHAIN O-RING 30 Ea. 15.00 450.00 11.50 345.00 

164 HYDRANT CHAIN S-HOOK 30 Ea. 3.00 90.00 1.75 52.50 

165 5 ¼” A423 NST UPPER SECTION 2 Ea. 2,400.00 4,800.00 1,851.00 3,702.00 

166 4 ½” IMPROVED PUMPER NOZZLE & CAP 30 Ea. 350.00 10,500.00 254.00 7,620.00 

167 2 ½” IMPROVED HYDRANT HOSE NOZZLE & CAP 30 Ea. 140.00 4,200.00 79.00 2,370.00 

168 MUELLER HYDRANT WRENCH 6 Ea. 55.00 330.00 37.50 225.00 

169 MULTI WRENCH, 4 HEADS 7 Ea. 29.00 203.00 No Bid 0.00 

170 4” MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 68.00 136.00 No Bid 0.00 

171 6” MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 4 Ea. 97.00 388.00 No Bid 0.00 

172 8” MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 130.00 260.00 No Bid 0.00 

173 10" MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 150.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

174 12" MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 185.00 370.00 No Bid 0.00 

175 16"MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 401.00 802.00 No Bid 0.00 

176 20" MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 560.00 1,120.00 No Bid 0.00 

177 24" MJ FIELD LOK GASKET 2 Ea. 801.00 1,602.00 No Bid 0.00 

178 6’ CURB KEY (POLLARD STYLE ADJ HANDLE) 7 Ea. 129.00 903.00 45.50 318.50 

179 6' CURB KEY ( 1 PIECE ) 7 Ea. 90.00 630.00 59.00 413.00 

180 6' BUFFALO KEY 7 Ea. 90.00 630.00 No Bid 0.00 

188 8' BUFFALO KEY 7 Ea. 150.00 1,050.00 No Bid 0.00 

189 6' 2" SQUARE VALVE KEY 7 Ea. 125.00 875.00 No Bid 0.00 

190 8' 2" SQUARE VALVE KEY 7 Ea. 150.00 1,050.00 No Bid 0.00 
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191 10' 2" SQUARE VALVE KEY 7 Ea. 180.00 1,260.00 No Bid 0.00 

192 6’ SHUT OFF ROD 7 Ea. 90.00 630.00 59.00 413.00 

193 ¾” X 4” SS MACH BOLT & NUT 60 Ea. 5.50 330.00 No Bid 0.00 

194 ¾” X 6” SS MACH BOLT & NUT 25 Ea. 12.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

195 5/8” X 3” SS MACH BOLT & NUT 60 Ea. 5.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

196 ¾” X 4” SS ANTI ROTATION BOLT & NUT 25 Ea. 19.00 475.00 No Bid 0.00 

197 ¾” x 6’ SS Threaded Rod 10 Ea. 65.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

198 1" X 6' SS THREADED ROD 10 Ea. 130.00 1,300.00 No Bid 0.00 

199 ¾” SS Rod Coupling 6 Ea. 13.00 78.00 No Bid 0.00 

200 1" SS ROD COUPLING 6 Ea. 35.00 210.00 No Bid 0.00 

201 3/4" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CORPORATION 2 Ea. 90.00 180.00 60.00 120.00 

202 1" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CORPORATION 2 Ea. 105.00 210.00 79.00 158.00 

203 2" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CORPORATION 2 Ea. 400.00 800.00 296.00 592.00 

204 3/4" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CURBSTOP VALVE 2 Ea. 120.00 240.00 85.00 170.00 

205 1" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CURBSTOP VALVE 2 Ea. 175.00 350.00 128.00 256.00 

206 2" COMP X COMP 300PSI NL CURBSTOP VALVE 2 Ea. 580.00 1,160.00 434.00 868.00 

207
1" MIP X 3/4" FIP BRASS REDUCER FOR WATER 

METER
2 Ea. 37.00 74.00 No Bid 0.00 

208 3/4" RUBBER METER WASHERS 1000 Ea. 0.50 500.00 No Bid 0.00 

209 1.5" FULL FACE METER GASKET (2 BOLT STYLE) 2 Ea. 5.00 10.00 No Bid 0.00 

210 2" FULL FACE METER GASKET (2 BOLT STYLE) 2 Ea. 5.50 11.00 No Bid 0.00 

211 1" RUBBER METER WASHERS 1000 Ea. 0.60 600.00 No Bid 0.00 

212 4" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 3.70 7.40 No Bid 0.00 

213 6" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 5.65 11.30 No Bid 0.00 

214 8" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 8.10 16.20 No Bid 0.00 

215 10" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 12.00 24.00 No Bid 0.00 

216 12" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 16.00 32.00 No Bid 0.00 

217 16" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 24.00 48.00 No Bid 0.00 
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218 20" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 30.00 60.00 No Bid 0.00 

219 24" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 39.00 78.00 No Bid 0.00 

220 36" FULL FLANGE GASKET 2 Ea. 58.00 116.00 No Bid 0.00 

221 6" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 1"CC 1 Ea. 190.00 190.00 137.00 137.00 

222
6" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 190.00 190.00 137.00 137.00 

223
8" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 240.00 240.00 170.00 170.00 

224
10"DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 295.00 295.00 211.00 211.00 

225
12" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 350.00 350.00 247.00 247.00 

226
16" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 800.00 800.00 627.00 627.00 

227
20" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 1,400.00 1,400.00 No Bid 0.00 

228
24" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 2,100.00 2,100.00 No Bid 0.00 

229
36" DUAL BRONZE STRAP BRONZE SADDLE W/ 

1"CC
1 Ea. 3,900.00 3,900.00 No Bid 0.00 

230 6" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 150.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

231 8" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 200.00 400.00 No Bid 0.00 

232 10" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 290.00 580.00 No Bid 0.00 

233 12" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 405.00 810.00 No Bid 0.00 

234 16" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 1,020.00 2,040.00 No Bid 0.00 

235 20" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 1,600.00 3,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

236 24" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 2,200.00 4,400.00 No Bid 0.00 

237 36" MJ SOLID SLEEVE 2 Ea. 7,900.00 15,800.00 No Bid 0.00 
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238 6" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 135.00 270.00 No Bid 0.00 

239 8"  MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 180.00 360.00 No Bid 0.00 

240 10" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 290.00 580.00 No Bid 0.00 

241 12" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 410.00 820.00 No Bid 0.00 

242 16" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,010.00 2,020.00 No Bid 0.00 

243 20" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,800.00 3,600.00 No Bid 0.00 

244 24" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 2,270.00 4,540.00 No Bid 0.00 

245 36" MJ 11 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 7,600.00 15,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

246 6" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 130.00 260.00 No Bid 0.00 

247 8" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 200.00 400.00 No Bid 0.00 

248 10" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 280.00 560.00 No Bid 0.00 

249 12" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 430.00 860.00 No Bid 0.00 

250 16" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,050.00 2,100.00 No Bid 0.00 

251 20" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,850.00 3,700.00 No Bid 0.00 

252 24" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 2,400.00 4,800.00 No Bid 0.00 

253 36" MJ 22 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 8,900.00 17,800.00 No Bid 0.00 

254 6" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 145.00 290.00 No Bid 0.00 

255 8" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 205.00 410.00 No Bid 0.00 

256 10" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 290.00 580.00 No Bid 0.00 

257 12" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 510.00 1,020.00 No Bid 0.00 

258 16" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,130.00 2,260.00 No Bid 0.00 

259 20" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,750.00 3,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

260 24" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 2,500.00 5,000.00 No Bid 0.00 

261 36" MJ 45 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 10,600.00 21,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

262 6" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 177.00 354.00 No Bid 0.00 

263 8" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 260.00 520.00 No Bid 0.00 

264 10" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 440.00 880.00 No Bid 0.00 

265 12" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 640.00 1,280.00 No Bid 0.00 
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266 16" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 1,450.00 2,900.00 No Bid 0.00 

267 20" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 2,650.00 5,300.00 No Bid 0.00 

268 24" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 4,850.00 9,700.00 No Bid 0.00 

269 36" MJ 90 DEGREE BEND 2 Ea. 12,900.00 25,800.00 No Bid 0.00 

270 6" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 290.00 290.00 No Bid 0.00 

271 8" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 430.00 430.00 No Bid 0.00 

272 10" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 570.00 570.00 No Bid 0.00 

273 12" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 660.00 660.00 No Bid 0.00 

274 16" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 1,180.00 1,180.00 No Bid 0.00 

275 20" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 1,700.00 1,700.00 No Bid 0.00 

276 24" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 2,650.00 2,650.00 No Bid 0.00 

277 36" MJ HYDRANT TEE 1 Ea. 5,700.00 5,700.00 No Bid 0.00 

278 6" X 6" X 6" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 250.00 250.00 No Bid 0.00 

279 8" X 8" X 8" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 375.00 375.00 No Bid 0.00 

280 10" X 10" X 10" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 650.00 650.00 No Bid 0.00 

281 12" X 12" X 12" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 825.00 825.00 No Bid 0.00 

282 16" X 16" X 16" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 2,200.00 2,200.00 No Bid 0.00 

283 20" X 20" X 20" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 4,300.00 4,300.00 No Bid 0.00 

284 24" X 24" X 24" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 5,500.00 5,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

285 36" X 36" X 36" MJ TEE 1 Ea. 21,050.00 21,050.00 No Bid 0.00 

286 6" X 8" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 170.00 170.00 No Bid 0.00 

287 8" X 10" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 235.00 235.00 No Bid 0.00 

288 10" X 12" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 385.00 385.00 No Bid 0.00 

289 12" X 16" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 840.00 840.00 No Bid 0.00 

290 16" X 20" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 1,350.00 1,350.00 No Bid 0.00 

291 20" X 24" MJ REDUCER 1 Ea. 2,270.00 2,270.00 No Bid 0.00 

292 ACRYLIC MARK OUT PAINT 17 OZ SPRAY 12 Ea. 8.00 96.00 No Bid 0.00 

293 MARKOUT FLAGS W/ 1" LETTERING 500 Ea. 0.20 100.00 No Bid 0.00 
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294 RUBBERIZED SPRAY COATING (UNDERCOATING) 12 Ea. 25.00 300.00 No Bid 0.00 

295 VINEGAR CLEANING SOLUTION 6% ( 1 GALLON ) 6 Ea. 23.00 138.00 No Bid 0.00 

296 STEEL WIRE BRUSH 6" 7 Ea. 10.00 70.00 No Bid 0.00 

297 3/4" COMP X COMP CTS TO IPS 2 Ea. 90.00 180.00 No Bid 0.00 

298 1" COMP X COMP CTS TO IPS 2 Ea. 115.00 230.00 No Bid 0.00 

299 2" COMP X COMP CTS TO IPS 2 Ea. 195.00 390.00 No Bid 0.00 

300 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 6 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 245.00 245.00 No Bid 0.00 

301 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 8 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 245.00 245.00 No Bid 0.00 

302 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 10 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 333.00 333.00 No Bid 0.00 

303 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 16 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 423.00 423.00 No Bid 0.00 

304 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 20 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 510.00 510.00 No Bid 0.00 

305 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 24 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 675.00 675.00 No Bid 0.00 

306 POLYWRAP (POLYETHYLENE ENCASEMENT 36 inches wide x 300 feet long roll – 8 mil. Thick1 Ea. 1,020.00 1,020.00 No Bid 0.00 

307 2X10 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (fits 2" turbine) (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 1,350.00 1,350.00 No Bid 0.00 

308 2X13 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (fits 1-1/2" MJ / PD) (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 1,500.00 1,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

309 2X15-1/4 OCTAVE SS FLOATING (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 1,525.00 1,525.00 No Bid 0.00 

310 2X17 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (fits 2" MJ / PD) (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 1,525.00 1,525.00 No Bid 0.00 

311 3X12 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 1,970.00 1,970.00 No Bid 0.00 

312 4X14 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 2,701.00 2,701.00 No Bid 0.00 

313 6X18 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE MXU)1 Ea. 4,850.00 4,850.00 No Bid 0.00 

314 8X20 OCTAVE SS FLOATING FLANGE (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 4,850.00 4,850.00 No Bid 0.00 

315 10X18 OCTAVE EPOXY Ductile Iron (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE& RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 9,810.00 9,810.00 No Bid 0.00 

316 12X20 OCTAVE EPOXY Ductile Iron (PRICE TO INCLUDE FLANGE GASKETS AND 316 SS INSTALLATION HARDWARE & RADIO READ PACKAGE FOR MXU)1 Ea. 11,680.00 11,680.00 No Bid 0.00 

317 20” X 36” B&T METER PIT 1 Ea. 97.00 97.00 No Bid 0.00 

318 RING AND LID B&T (W/LOCKING BOLT & TOUCH READ HOLE) 1 Ea. 147.00 147.00 No Bid 0.00 

319 1” MUELLER METER YOKE W/DUAL ANGLE CHECK VALVE, CTS COMPRESSION ENDS1 Ea. 580.00 580.00 439.00 439.00 

320 MUELLER 2” EZ-VAULT 36” X 42” 1 Ea. 4,900.00 4,900.00 3,950.00 3,950.00 

321 DETECTABLE UNDERGROUND CAUTION TAPE ALUMINUM/POLY TAPE BLUE “BURIED WATER”1 Ea. 33.00 33.00 No Bid 0.00 
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323 ¾” X 60’ COPPER TYPE K 1 Ea. 580.00 580.00 No Bid 0.00 

324 1” X 60’ COPPER TYPE K 1 Ea. 770.00 770.00 No Bid 0.00 

325 2” X 40 COPPER TYPE K 1 Ea. 1,300.00 1,300.00 No Bid 0.00 

326 ¾” X 100’ COPPER TYPE K 1 Ea. 960.00 960.00 No Bid 0.00 

327 1” X 100’ COPPER TYPE K 1 Ea. 1,270.00 1,270.00 No Bid 0.00 

328 ¾” PVC SERVICE SADDLE BRASS BODY W/ DOUBLE SS STRAPS1 Ea. 210.00 210.00 No Bid 0.00 

329 1” PVC SERVICE SADDLE BRASS BODY W/ DOUBLE SS STRAPS1 Ea. 210.00 210.00 No Bid 0.00 

330 2” PVC SERVICE SADDLE BRASS BODY W/ DOUBLE SS STRAPS1 Ea. 270.00 270.00 No Bid 0.00 

331 PVC UTILITY POST MARKER BLUE FOR WATER UTILITY 10 Ea. 28.00 280.00 No Bid 0.00 

332 33” - 48” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX “FLUSH” LID TO INDICATE WATER25 Ea. 110.00 2,750.00 No Bid 0.00 

333 33” - 54” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX “FLUSH” LID TO INDICATE WATER25 Ea. 125.00 3,125.00 No Bid 0.00 

334 40” - 60” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX “FLUSH” LID TO INDICATE WATER25 Ea. 140.00 3,500.00 No Bid 0.00 

335 6” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX RISER 25 Ea. 32.00 800.00 No Bid 0.00 

336 12” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX RISER 25 Ea. 40.00 1,000.00 No Bid 0.00 

337 24” B&T 2.5” USA VALVE BOX RISER 25 Ea. 40.00 1,000.00 No Bid 0.00 

338 29” BRITESIDE YELLOW REFLECTIVE HYDRANT BANNER WITH 1” BLACK LETTERING UP TO 15 CHARACTERS25 Ea. 53.00 1,325.00 No Bid 0.00 

* 723,514.90 200,785.00 

* Amount adjusted for mathematical errors.
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